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Title IX Guidance for Faculty and Staff: How to Compassionately  

Address Disclosures by Survivors of Sexual Harassment  

Sexual assault, stalking, dating violence, domestic violence, quid pro quo harassment, and 
hostile environment harassment are all considered forms of sexual harassment, and are 
prohibited at NEIU. While the University makes extensive efforts to provide prevention 
education about sexual harassment and eliminate it as a campus-wide effort, members of our 
campus community experience incidents on and off campus. The following is guidance for how 
faculty and staff can compassionately handle situations where a person shares sensitive 
information about being a survivor of sexual harassment.  
 
How to Handle a Disclosure  

Students or co-workers at NEIU may disclose sexual harassment to you for many reasons, 
including:  
 

ǒ
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Making a Report  

If the student or co-worker does share information that activates your mandatory reporter 
obligations, you should contact the Title IX Office to report any relevant information that is 
shared (titleix@neiu.edu). This includes the name of the Complainant, name of the Respondent 
(if you know), and any incident details shared. There is no need to ask for more information. 
 
The Title IX Office is not permitted to share any information about the situation with you after 
you submit a Title IX report. This is to protect the privacy of Complainants and Respondents. 
The Complainant may share any information with you, but please be sensitive in not pressuring 
them for further information. For helpful guidance on your mandatory reporter obligations, 
please see this video. 
 
Supporting a Survivor 

The following are supportive ways to respond to a student or co-worker who has disclosed that 
they are a survivor of sexual misconduct. 
 
Say Thank You  

Disclosing can be scary. It is important to acknowledge the personôs courage and vulnerability to 
share with you. Things you can say are ñthank you for trusting meò and ñthank you for sharing 
with me.ò  
 
Mirror Language  

The fear of not being believed is a real concern for people who have experienced an assault or 
interpersonal violence. Mirror the language of the person disclosing to you. If they label their 
experience as ñharassment,ò it can be harmful to use another word like ñflirting.ò Similarly, 
asking certain types of questions about the situation (i.e. ñwhyò questions) may be viewed as 
judgmental, disbelief, or victim-blaming.

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=YwvRSaCY7G8&authuser=0
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Offer Resources   

You should provide the person with the Notice of Rights and Options, which includes community 
resources. Offer to make a phone call or go to a non-profit with the person if you are 
comfortable doing so.  
 
Respect the Person’s Decisions and Privacy 

There is no wrong way for a person to react and process a traumatic experience. It is important 
to empower a survivor to make their own decisions about what to do following an incident, 
including decisions about reporting and seeking help. The personôs decision to report or seek 
support is the survivorôs alone, but your involvement can be encouraging and positive.  
 
Get Support for Yourself  

It is important to take care of your needs as well. Supporting a survivor can take an emotional 
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